

BID TABULATION  
 Edgerton Tanks Rehabilitation  
 Village of Edgerton, Ohio  
 Job Number: 20223454.0001A

Bids Received: Monday, April 25, 2022 at 10:00 a.m.  
 Engineer's Estimate: \$932,800

Poggemeyer Design Group, Inc.  
 1168 North Main Street  
 Bowling Green, Ohio 43402

D&M Painting Corporation  
 1500 Amity Ridge Road  
 Washington, Pennsylvania 15301

Utility Service Company, Inc.  
 535 Courtney Hodges Boulevard  
 P.O. Box 1350  
 Perry, Georgia 31069

Ref. No.	Description	Estimated Quantity	Unit	Unit Price	Total Price	Unit Price	Total Price
<u>Base Bid</u>							
	Exterior Repaint with Containment (Including 2 Logos on Each						
1	Tank)	1	L.S.	\$431,120.00	\$431,120.00	463,400.00	\$463,400.00
2	Wet Interior Repaint	1	L.S.	\$172,000.00	\$172,000.00	\$154,800.00	\$154,800.00
3	Caulk Roof Lap Seams	1	L.S.	\$4,800.00	\$4,800.00	\$9,800.00	\$9,800.00
4	Foundation Spall Repair	1	L.S.	\$5,200.00	\$5,200.00	\$4,800.00	\$4,800.00
5	Restoration	1	L.S.	\$6,000.00	\$6,000.00	\$4,800.00	\$4,800.00
6	Bond and Insurance	1	L.S.	\$10,000.00	\$10,000.00	\$6,600.00	\$6,600.00
7	Mobilization and Demobilization	1	L.S.	\$16,000.00	\$16,000.00	\$19,900.00	\$19,900.00
CORRECTED BASE BID PRICE					<b>\$645,120.00</b>		
BASE BID PRICE AS SUBMITTED					\$653,120.00		\$664,100.00
<u>Alternate Bid</u>							
1A	Deduct to Only Provide One Logo on Each Tank	1		No Bid	No Bid	15,000.00	\$15,000.00
CORRECTED ALTERNATE BID PRICE							
ALTERNATE BID PRICE AS SUBMITTED					No Bid		\$15,000.00
BASE BID PLUS ALTERNATE BID					No Bid		\$649,100.00
BID BOND					Yes		Yes
					Used Incorrect Bid Form		
					No Addendum No. 2		

BID TABULATION  
 Edgerton Tanks Rehabilitation  
 Village of Edgerton, Ohio  
 Job Number: 20223454.0001A

Bids Received: Monday, April 25, 2022 at 10:00 a.m.  
 Engineer's Estimate: \$932,800

Poggemeyer Design Group, Inc.  
 1168 North Main Street  
 Bowling Green, Ohio 43402

Viking Painting, LLC  
 P.O. Box 24162  
 Omaha, Nebraska 68124

Seven Brothers Painting, Inc.  
 50805 Rizzo Drive  
 Shelby Township, Michigan 48315

Ref. No.	Description	Estimated Quantity	Unit	Unit Price	Total Price	Unit Price	Total Price
<u>Base Bid</u>							
	Exterior Repaint with Containment (Including 2 Logos on Each						
1	Tank)	1	L.S.	\$527,200.00	\$527,200.00	598,000.00	\$598,000.00
2	Wet Interior Repaint	1	L.S.	\$102,100.00	\$102,100.00	\$142,600.00	\$142,600.00
3	Caulk Roof Lap Seams	1	L.S.	\$11,600.00	\$11,600.00	\$7,000.00	\$7,000.00
4	Foundation Spall Repair	1	L.S.	\$6,600.00	\$6,600.00	\$8,500.00	\$8,500.00
5	Restoration	1	L.S.	\$10,900.00	\$10,900.00	\$10,000.00	\$10,000.00
6	Bond and Insurance	1	L.S.	\$5,000.00	\$5,000.00	\$19,300.00	\$19,300.00
7	Mobilization and Demobilization	1	L.S.	\$19,700.00	\$19,700.00	\$10,000.00	\$10,000.00
CORRECTED BASE BID PRICE							
BASE BID PRICE AS SUBMITTED					\$683,100.00		\$795,400.00
<u>Alternate Bid</u>							
1A	Deduct to Only Provide One Logo on Each Tank	1		\$10,000.00	\$10,000.00	4,000.00	\$4,000.00
CORRECTED ALTERNATE BID PRICE							
ALTERNATE BID PRICE AS SUBMITTED					\$10,000.00		\$10,000.00
BASE BID PLUS ALTERNATE BID					\$673,100.00		\$791,400.00
BID BOND					Yes		Yes not unit

BID TABULATION  
 Edgerton Tanks Rehabilitation  
 Village of Edgerton, Ohio  
 Job Number: 20223454.0001A

Bids Received: Monday, April 25, 2022 at 10:00 a.m.  
 Engineer's Estimate: \$932,800

Poggemeyer Design Group, Inc.  
 1168 North Main Street  
 Bowling Green, Ohio 43402

L.C. United Painting Company, Inc.  
 3625 Barbara Drive  
 Sterling Heights, Michigan 48310

Ref. No.	Description	Estimated Quantity	Unit	Unit Price	Total Price	Average
<u>Base Bid</u>						
	Exterior Repaint with Containment (Including 2 Logos on Each					
1	Tank)	1	L.S.	\$680,000.00	\$680,000.00	\$539,944.00
2	Wet Interior Repaint	1	L.S.	\$198,000.00	\$198,000.00	\$153,900.00
3	Caulk Roof Lap Seams	1	L.S.	\$7,000.00	\$7,000.00	\$8,040.00
4	Foundation Spall Repair	1	L.S.	\$49,000.00	\$49,000.00	\$14,820.00
5	Restoration	1	L.S.	\$5,000.00	\$5,000.00	\$7,340.00
6	Bond and Insurance	1	L.S.	\$15,000.00	\$15,000.00	\$11,180.00
7	Mobilization and Demobilization	1	L.S.	\$12,000.00	\$12,000.00	\$15,520.00
	CORRECTED BASE BID PRICE				\$966,000.00	
	BASE BID PRICE AS SUBMITTED				\$973,000.00	
<u>Alternate Bid</u>						
1A	Deduct to Only Provide One Logo on Each Tank	1		No Bid	No Bid	\$9,666.67
	CORRECTED ALTERNATE BID PRICE					
	ALTERNATE BID PRICE AS SUBMITTED				No Bid	
	BASE BID PLUS ALTERNATE BID					
	BID BOND				Yes	
					Used Incorrect Bid Form	
					No Addendum No. 2	